Bid Tab

General Motors Gregg Young Husker Auto Sid Dillon
Light Duty Trucks
Bid Code| Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine
c1 Chevrolet Colorado 2.7L Turbo 2.7L Turbo Plus |2.7L TurboMax| N/A 2.7L Turbo 2.7L Turbo Plus 2.7L TurboMax N/A 2.7L Turbo 2.7L Turbo Plus 2.7L TurboMax N/A
C11B Chevrolet Colorado A N/A N/A NO NO No Bid No Bid No Bid
C11D Chevrolet Colorado N/A N/A N/A NO NO NO No Bid No Bid No Bid
c12 Chevorlet | Silverado 1500 | 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 |.2L EcoTec3 V| 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 | 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 | 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 | 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 | 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel
C12A2 | Chevorlet Silverado 1500 |N/A N/A N/A N/A NO NO NO NO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C12B2 | Chevorlet Silverado 1500 |N/A N/A N/A N/A NO NO NO NO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C12 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 | 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 |.2L EcoTec3 V| 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 | 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 | 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 | 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 | 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel
C12C2 | Chevorlet Silverado 1500 |N/A N/A N/A N/A NO NO NO NO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C12D2 ] Chevorlet Silverado 1500 _|N/A N/A N/A N/A NO NO NO NO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
c12 Chevorlet | Silverado 1500 | 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 |.2L EcoTec3 V| 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 | 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 | 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 | 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 | 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel
C12E Chevorlet Silverado 1500  [$39,627 $42,307 N/A $44,022 $40,727.00 $43,317.00 NO $43,717 $40,724.00 $43,316.00 No Bid $43,712
C12F Chevorlet Silverado 1500 _|$42,033 $44,713 N/A $46,428 $43,137.00 $45,717.00 NO $46,117 $43,130.00 $45,722.00 No Bid $46,118
C12 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 | 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 |.2L EcoTec3 V| 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 | 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 | 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 | 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 | 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel
C12G Chevorlet Silverado 1500 |$41,713 $44,393 N/A $46,108 $42,807.00 $46,297.00 NO $45,797 $42,810.00 $45,402.00 No Bid $45,798
C12H Chevorlet Silverado 1500 |$44.120 $46,800 N/A $48,515 1845.217.00 $47,807.00 NO $47,627 $45,216.00 No Bid No Bid $47,627
c12 Chevorlet | Silverado 1500 | 2.7L Ti 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 |.2L EcoTec3 V| 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 | 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 | 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax | 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 | 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 | 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel
c121 Chevorlet Silverado 1500  [$41,987 $44,667 N/A $46,382 $43,087.00 $45,677.00 NO $46,067 $43,083.00 $45,675.00 No Bid $46,071
C12J) Chevorlet Silverado 1500 _|$44,393 $47,073 N/A $48,788 $45,487.00 $48,087.00 NO $48,477 $45,490.00 $48,082.00 No Bid $48,478
Provide a standard percentage (%) discount
for additional Manufacturer Models not listed
above or that may have not been released at
the t‘l’me of this bid. B 5% 2%
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE
OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP
Total: $757,269 $767,359.00 $766,454.00
Total from Heavy duty: $1,827,368.00 $1,818,517.00 $1,827,428.00
Basket total: $2,584,637 $2,585,876.00 $2,593,882.00

Yellow highlight mark vehicle that was excluded from bid tabulation




Bid Tab
General Motors Gregg Young Husker Auto Sid Dillon
Heavy Duty Trucks
Bid . . . . . .
Code Make Model Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine Engine
C13 Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 | 6.6L V8 Gas| 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8
C13A | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 [$43,191 $51,827 $43,332.00 [$51,677 $43,635.00 [$51,986
C13B | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 |$45,128 $53,764 $45,267 $53,617 $45,572 $53,923
C13 Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 | 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8
C13C | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 |$43,953 $52,589 $44,037.00 [$52,387 $44,347.00 [$52,698
C13D | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 |$45,840 $54,476 $45,977 $54,327 $46,284 $54,635
C13 Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 | 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8
C13E | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 |$44,084 $52,720 $44,217.00  |$52,567 $44,578.00 [$52,929
C13F | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 [$46,021 $54,657 $46,157 $54,507 $46,465 $54,816
C13 Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 | 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8
C13G | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 |$45,734 $54,370 $45,867.00 [$54,217 $46,178.00  |$54,529
C13H | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 |$47,671 $56,307 $47,807 $56,157 $48,115 $56,466
C13 Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 | 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8
C13l | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 |$45,915 $54,551 $46,047.00 |$54,407 $46,359.00 [$54,710
C13J | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 2500 |$47,852 $56,488 $47,987 $56,337 $48,296 $56,647
C14 | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 3500 | 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8
C14A | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 3500 |$44,938 $53,574 $44,417.00 |$52,767 $44,722.00 [$53,073
C14B | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 3500 |$46,875 $55,511 $46,347.00 [$54,707 $46,659.00 [$55,010
C14 | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 3500 | 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8
C14C | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 3500 |$45,831 $54,467 $45,307.00 [$53,657 $45,616.00 [$53,967
C14D | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 3500 [$47,768 $56,404 $47,247 $55,597 $47,433.00 |$55,784
C14 | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 3500 | 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas | 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8
C14E | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 3500 |$48,481 $57,117 $46,957.00 [$55,307 $47,265.00 [$55,616
C14F | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 3500 [$49,417 $58,053 $48,897.00 [$57,347.00 $49,202.00 |$57,553.00
C14G | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 3500 |$47,662 $56,298 $51,077.00 |$55,487.00 $47,446.00 [$55,797.00
C14H | Chevorlet | Silverado HD 3500 [$49,599 $58,235 $49,077.00  [$57,427.00 $49,383.00  [$59,734.00
Provide a standard percentage (%) discount
Jfor additional Manufacturer Models not listed
above or that may have nt_)t b(:;en released at 3% 5%
the time of this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE
OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

Total: $1,827,368 $1,818,517.00 $1,827,428.00



	GM - Light Duty Truck
	GM - Heavy Duty Truck

